
Cruisin’ with Cassin LLC – Individual Tour Registration 

169 Kentucky Street, Shelbyville, KY 40065 

Please fill in completely and return with your deposit. For more than one trip, please fill out another form. 

 

Tour name: ________________________________ Tour Date: ________ Tour Cost: __________ 

 

Please list your name as it appears on your passport or driver’s license. 

 

Name: _____________________________________________     Birth date: __________________ 

 

Name: _____________________________________________     Birth date: __________________ 

 

Street address: _____________________________  City, State & Zip:________________________ 

 

Home phone: _____________________ Cell phone: _____________   Other: __________________ 

 

Email address: ____________________ Preferred way to be contacted: ______________________ 
                                       (required) 

 

Roommate (if applicable) :__________________________________________________________ 

 

Emergency contact #1: ___________________________________ phone number: _____________ 

 

Emergency contact #2: ___________________________________ phone number: _____________ 

 

A deposit is due at the time of booking. Deposits and money paid are refundable up to 45 days prior to departure; less any non-

recoverable expenditures made on behalf of the participant at the time of cancellation and a $10 processing fee. Within 45 days of 

departure, all money paid is non-refundable. Trip insurance is encouraged especially for long and expensive trips. By choosing to join 

this trip, it is understood that Joyce Cassin/Cruisin’ with Cassin is only acting as an agent in sponsoring the components of this trip. It is 

understood that Joyce Cassin/ Cruisin’ with Cassin will not be held liable for any accident or personal injury on this/these trips. It is also 

understood that Joyce Cassin/Cruisin’ with Cassin cannot be held responsible due to delays caused by the motor coach, construction, 

or other actions beyond our control. It is also understood that due to the advance planning of these tours, Cruisin’ with Cassin reserves 

the right to make changes or substitutions in order to improve the tour. 

I have read and understood and agree to all Terms and Conditions and Tour Policies. Registration and payment of deposit constitutes 

your agreement to all Policies and Terms and Conditions. 

 

Signature: ____________________________________    Date: ___________________________ 

_Tour Information and Policies 

 

Deposit Amount enclosed: ______________________________            Check Number: _____________    Cash:________ 

 



Tour  policies 

Prices & What's Included 

Prices quoted are per person. Room rates are available for single, triple or quadruple occupancy if applicable. 

All tour prices are based on rates known at the time of printing and expected to be in effect at the time of 

departure. They are subject to increase without notice, if such rates change prior to departure. Cruisin’ with 

Cassin reserves the right to pass on unforeseen additional charges. Prices include transportation by motor 

coach or mini coach, hotel rooms, and items included in the " Included" section listed with the individual tour. 

Gratuities for meals that are listed as part of the itinerary are included in the price of tour. However, gratuities 

for meals on your own, are not included. Gratuities to tour guides and drivers are voluntary. Travel insurance is 

not included. You can purchase travel insurance through Travel Guard. 

Tour Cost Does Not Include: 
Meals and tips other than those specified in the itinerary, maids, waitresses, valet and laundry service, phone 
calls, room service, alcoholic beverages and items of personal nature. Gratuities for: Local Guides and Tour 
Director and Driver are not included. Any gratuities are strictly voluntary and should be done on an individual 
basis, not as a group. We recommend you tip your driver and escort separately. This also applies to any step 
on guides. The rule of thumb is $2 per day. The amount is totally up to the individual traveler and should be 
based on the performance in which they served. 

Luggage 
Each person is allowed one large suitcase (22x10x32) that does not exceed 50 lbs. OR for air travel, 
compliance with individual airline policies which will be disclosed at confirmation. 

Roommates 
Prices are based on double occupancy. Each person making a reservation is responsible for finding their own 
roommate(s). Due to prices being based on double occupancy, if you are unable to find a suitable 
roommate(s), you will be billed for a single rate. Prices available for triple or quadruple occupancy. 
Roommate(s) are to be denoted on the Registration form. 

Reservations, Deposit and Final Payment 
Registration and deposits are encouraged to be mailed in as quickly as possible in order to secure a seat. Mail 
to: Cruisin with Cassin, 169 Kentucky St. Shelbyville, KY 40065. 

Final payment is due 45 days prior to departure. Mail final payment to Cruisin with Cassin, 169 Kentucky St. 
Shelbyville, KY 40065. Final payments not made 45 days prior to departure will be accessed a 10% late fee or 
can be canceled resulting in loss of deposit. 

Cancelation 
Tours are priced assuming that there will be a minimum number of people Approximately 45 days prior to 
departure of the trip, if this number has not been reached, we reserve the right cancel the tour. Should the tour 
be close to having the required number of passengers, Cruisin’ with Cassin will offer the option of a price 
increase to ensure the tour will continue. If we must cancel, we will refund your money. 

Refunds 
In the event you need to cancel your trip, we will refund your money in full less any non-recoverable 
expenditures made on behalf of the participant at the time of the cancellation. These costs would be for meals, 
rooms, tickets, bus, etc. There will also be a $10.00 handling fee for each cancellation. After 45 day, all money 
will be forfeited.  There will be no refunds on unused portions of the trip. There will be no refunds for 
cancellations made once the tour departs.   

 

As of this printing, face masks are not required on coaches and in public places. 

http://www.travelguard.com/compare/pct.asp?ta_arc=334243&pc=PCTUSASLG&agencyemail=mickeymartin@tds.net

